
Organizational Assessment Form - Evaluating Mission and Goals
Achievement

Organization Name: _____________________________________________
Assessment Date: ________________________________________________

1. Organizational Mission Statement: Please write down your
organization's mission statement.

2. Goals: Please list down the major goals set by your organization
for this assessment period.

Mission and Goals Evaluation:

1. Goal Achievement: For each goal listed, please provide a brief
explanation of the extent to which the goal has been achieved. If
the goal has not been fully met, please indicate any progress
made and the obstacles encountered.

a) Goal 1: Achievement Level (Not Achieved / Partially Achieved / Fully
Achieved): Explanation:

b) Goal 2: Achievement Level (Not Achieved / Partially Achieved / Fully
Achieved): Explanation:

(Repeat for additional goals as needed.)



2. Alignment with Mission: For each goal, please describe how it
aligns with your organization's mission.

a) Goal 1: Alignment Explanation:

b) Goal 2: Alignment Explanation:

(Repeat for additional goals as needed.)

3. Organizational Impact: Please describe the impact of achieving (or
not achieving) these goals on your organization.

4. Lessons Learned: Please share any significant lessons learned
during this period that might help in the setting or achievement of
future goals.

5. Suggestions for Improvement: If applicable, please provide any
suggestions for improving goal setting, alignment with the
mission, or strategies for achieving goals in the future.

Signature: ____________________ Date: ________________



Good morning/afternoon everyone,

Today, we are delving into a critical component of our leadership
development journey - "Organizational Assessment." This session aims
to provide an understanding of how an organizational assessment can
serve as a foundation for our future leadership development strategies.

An organizational assessment is much like a health checkup for your
company. It gives us a snapshot of our existing capabilities, strengths,
and weaknesses. Just as a doctor uses diagnostic tools to understand a
patient's health, we too use various tools and techniques to assess our
organization's current state.

So, what does an organizational assessment entail? It's an
all-encompassing review of your organization's systems, culture,
structure, and results. It investigates your business strategies, human
resources, financial management, operations, and more. The ultimate
goal is to identify areas of strength that can be leveraged and areas of
weakness that need improvement.

One critical aspect of an organizational assessment is that it provides a
baseline to measure future progress. When we embark on any journey,
it's crucial to know our starting point. An organizational assessment
helps us understand where we currently stand and then chart the
course for where we want to go.

Another crucial role of organizational assessment is to help align our
future leadership development strategies with the organization's
strategic goals and culture. Leadership does not operate in a vacuum.



Leaders must understand the organization's broader goals and culture
to effectively steer their teams towards these objectives.

By comprehensively understanding our current organizational context,
we can design more effective leader development plans. Plans that not
only hone individual leadership skills but also align these skills with the
organization's strategic direction.

Now, let's explore the various stages of conducting an organizational
assessment:

Stage 1: Planning - Define the scope of the assessment, the methods
and tools to be used, and the team responsible for carrying it out.
Ensure to involve representatives from different levels of the
organization for a holistic view.

Stage 2: Data Collection - Collect data from various sources such as
surveys, interviews, focus groups, and existing documentation. Make
sure to include feedback from employees at all levels.

Stage 3: Data Analysis - Analyze the data collected to identify patterns,
trends, strengths, and areas for improvement. Use the data to
understand the alignment between your organization's strategic goals
and current capabilities.

Stage 4: Reporting - Compile your findings into a comprehensive report.
The report should clearly present the current state of the organization,
the gaps identified, and recommendations for improvements.



Stage 5: Action Planning - Use the assessment results to develop an
action plan. This plan should include the development goals for future
leaders that align with the organization's strategic goals and culture.

Stage 6: Implementation & Review - Implement the action plan and
regularly review its effectiveness. Remember, organizational
assessment is not a one-time event, but a cyclical process. It should be
repeated at regular intervals to track progress and adjust plans as
necessary.

An organizational assessment is more than just a tool for identifying
problems. It's a strategic instrument that can be used to leverage
strengths, create opportunities, and drive organizational change. It's an
essential part of your toolkit when creating leader development plans
that are tailored to the unique needs and goals of your organization.

In our upcoming sessions, we'll delve deeper into each stage of the
organizational assessment process, including practical exercises and
case studies. We aim to equip you with the skills and knowledge
needed to conduct a thorough and insightful organizational
assessment.

As we conclude today's session, I encourage you to reflect on how an
organizational assessment could benefit your specific role and your
organization as a whole. I welcome any questions, thoughts, or insights
you would like to share.



Good morning/afternoon everyone,

Welcome to our module on "Creating Leader Development Plans:
Incorporating Organizational Assessment and Evaluating Current
Managers' Skills". This session aims to elucidate the integral steps for
creating Leader Development Plans (LDPs) which align with your
organization's unique needs and values and cultivates leadership
within.

Before we start, let's understand why an organizational assessment and
the evaluation of current managers' skills are pivotal in designing an
effective LDP:

1. Organizational Assessment: This provides a snapshot of our
existing capabilities and areas needing improvement. It offers us a
baseline to gauge future progress and aids in aligning the
leadership development of future leaders with the organization's
strategic goals and culture.

2. Evaluating Current Managers: This step establishes the
benchmark for leadership performance within the organization. It
aids in identifying the skills that have facilitated our success so far
and those which we would like our future leaders to possess or
improve upon.

Now, let's explore the steps to incorporate these two elements into our
LDPs creation process:



Step 1 - Organizational Assessment: Begin by understanding your
organization's strategic objectives, current state, and the gaps in
between. Leverage assessment tools like surveys, interviews, or focus
groups to collect data about your organization's strengths and
weaknesses.

Step 2 - Evaluation of Current Managers: Use tools such as 360-degree
feedback, performance appraisals, or skill assessments to understand
the competencies and performance levels of your current managers.
This step will help recognize the effective leadership traits within your
organization and identify areas for improvement in your future leaders.

Step 3 - Identification of Potential Leaders: Armed with the insights
from the organizational assessment and managers' evaluation, identify
employees who display potential for leadership roles. Consider their
performance, skill set, attitude, and alignment with the organization's
culture and values.

Step 4 - Leadership Development Goals: Based on the assessment
results, outline clear, measurable, and relevant leadership development
goals for each potential leader.

Step 5 - Implementation: Develop and deploy a mix of tailored training
programs, mentorship, coaching, job rotation, and other initiatives to
help potential leaders achieve their development goals.

Step 6 - Monitoring & Evaluation: Regularly track the progress of
potential leaders, evaluate the effectiveness of the LDPs, and tweak
them as needed to ensure continuous improvement.



In our subsequent sessions, we'll delve deeper into each of these steps,
ensuring you walk away with a robust understanding of creating
effective Leader Development Plans.

As we wrap up today's session, I encourage you to ask any questions or
share your thoughts about the topics we've discussed.



Comprehensive Organizational Assessment Form for Leadership
Development Plan (LDP)

Organization Name: _____________________________________________________
Assessment Date: ________________________________________________________

I. Organizational Mission and Goals: Please write down your
organization's mission statement and the major goals for the
assessment period. Discuss the extent of their achievement and their
alignment with the organization's mission.

II. Current Organizational Structure: Detail the current structure of your
organization, roles, and responsibilities. Identify the key
decision-makers and leaders.

III. Organizational Culture: Describe the culture of your organization.
How is it manifested in the values, behaviors, and attitudes of your
employees?

IV. Leadership Styles: Detail the predominant leadership styles within
your organization. How do these styles affect team dynamics and
overall performance?

V. Current Managers Evaluation: Evaluate the skills and performance of
current managers using suitable methods such as 360-degree
feedback, performance appraisals, or skill assessments.



VI. Skills Assessment: Assess key competencies like strategic planning,
team management, decision making, and communication of your
managerial team.

VII. Managerial KPIs: Indicate the key performance indicators that
measure managerial success in your organization.

VIII. Growth Mindset Evaluation: Evaluate the presence and promotion
of a growth mindset in your organization, both at the managerial level
and among other employees.

IX. Diversity, Equity, Inclusion (DEI) Analysis: Evaluate the extent to
which diversity, equity, and inclusion are present and promoted in your
organization.

X. Ethics Analysis: Assess the level of ethical conduct maintained in your
organization.

XI. Potential Candidate Assessment: Identify potential candidates for
leadership roles and assess their skills, competencies, and potential for
growth.

XII. Leadership Development Goals: Based on the assessment results,
outline clear, measurable, and relevant leadership development goals
for each potential leader.

XIII. Leader Development Plan: Detail the plan designed to develop
leadership skills in potential candidates.



XIV. Implementation of Leadership Development Activities: Discuss the
planned implementation of tailored training programs, mentorship,
coaching, or job rotation initiatives to help potential leaders achieve
their development goals.

XV. Monitoring & Evaluation Plan: Outline the plan to regularly track the
progress of potential leaders, evaluate the effectiveness of the LDPs,
and tweak them as needed to ensure continuous improvement.

Signature: ______________________ Date: ______________________


